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The distinction between Assessment for learning and 
assessment of learning; School-Based Assessment, Continuous & 
Comprehensive Evaluation: perspective and practice MCQ 

Question 1: Assessment for learning primarily focuses on: a) Assigning grades and 
rankings to students b) Summative evaluations c) Monitoring student progress and 
adjusting instruction d) Testing memorization skills 

Answer: c) Monitoring student progress and adjusting instruction 

Question 2: Assessment of learning primarily involves: a) Adjusting teaching 
methods b) Providing formative feedback c) Continuous monitoring of student 
progress d) Summative evaluations and assigning grades 

Answer: d) Summative evaluations and assigning grades 

Question 3: School-Based Assessment refers to: a) Assessments conducted by 
external agencies only b) Assessments solely based on final exams c) Assessments 
conducted within the school by teachers d) Assessments conducted by parents 

Answer: c) Assessments conducted within the school by teachers 

Question 4: Continuous and Comprehensive Evaluation (CCE) refers to: a) Only 
assessing cognitive skills b) Assessing students through a single final exam c) 
Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the year d) 
Assessing only at the end of the academic year 

Answer: c) Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the 

year 

Question 5: The primary purpose of Assessment for learning is to: a) Assign grades 
and rankings to students b) Determine the overall achievement of students c) Guide 
instruction and improve learning d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: c) Guide instruction and improve learning 

Question 6: The primary purpose of Assessment of learning is to: a) Provide 
formative feedback to students b) Guide instructional planning c) Identify areas for 
improvement in instruction d) Determine the overall achievement of students 

Answer: d) Determine the overall achievement of students 
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Question 7: Formative assessments are used to: a) Assign final grades b) Evaluate 
student achievement at the end of the year c) Monitor student progress and provide 
feedback d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: c) Monitor student progress and provide feedback 

Question 8: Summative assessments are used to: a) Assign grades during the 
academic year b) Evaluate student achievement at the end of the year c) Monitor 
student progress and provide feedback d) Compare students' performance to each 
other 

Answer: b) Evaluate student achievement at the end of the year 

Question 9: In Assessment for learning, feedback is primarily used to: a) Assign 
final grades b) Compare students' performance to each other c) Guide instructional 
decisions and help students improve d) Determine overall student achievement 

Answer: c) Guide instructional decisions and help students improve 

Question 10: In Assessment of learning, feedback is primarily used to: a) Guide 
instructional decisions and help students improve b) Compare students' performance 
to each other c) Assign final grades d) Determine overall student achievement 

Answer: c) Assign final grades 

Question 11: Which of the following statements is true about Assessment for 

learning? a) It focuses on assigning grades based on final exams only b) It takes place 
only at the end of the academic year c) It guides instruction and helps students 
improve d) It assesses students' overall achievement 

Answer: c) It guides instruction and helps students improve 

Question 12: Which of the following statements is true about Assessment of 

learning? a) It guides instruction and helps students improve b) It takes place only at 
the beginning of the academic year c) It assesses students' overall achievement d) It 
focuses solely on formative assessments 

Answer: c) It assesses students' overall achievement 

Question 13: School-Based Assessment is conducted by: a) External agencies b) 
Parents only c) Teachers within the school d) Private tutors 

Answer: c) Teachers within the school 
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Question 14: Which of the following is a key characteristic of Continuous and 

Comprehensive Evaluation (CCE)? a) Assessing students only through final exams 
b) Relying solely on teacher judgment for evaluations c) Using various assessment 
tools and methods throughout the year d) Conducting assessments only at the end of 
the year 

Answer: c) Using various assessment tools and methods throughout the year 

Question 15: In Assessment for learning, assessments are used to: a) Determine 
overall student achievement b) Monitor student progress and provide feedback c) 
Assign grades based on final exams d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: b) Monitor student progress and provide feedback 

Question 16: In Assessment of learning, assessments are used to: a) Guide 
instructional decisions and help students improve b) Monitor student progress and 
provide feedback c) Determine overall student achievement d) Compare students' 
performance to each other 

Answer: c) Determine overall student achievement 

Question 17: The main goal of Continuous and Comprehensive Evaluation (CCE) 

is to: a) Assign grades and rankings to students b) Monitor student progress only at 
the end of the academic year c) Continuously assess and improve student learning 
through various methods d) Rely solely on teacher judgment for evaluations 

Answer: c) Continuously assess and improve student learning through various 

methods 

Question 18: Assessment for learning emphasizes: a) Assigning grades based on 
formative assessments b) Comparing students' performance to each other c) 
Determining overall student achievement d) Providing feedback and guiding 
instruction 

Answer: d) Providing feedback and guiding instruction 

Question 19: Assessment of learning emphasizes: a) Providing formative feedback 
to students b) Monitoring student progress and adjusting instruction c) Determining 
overall student achievement d) Using a variety of assessment methods throughout the 
year 

Answer: c) Determining overall student achievement 
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Question 20: Formative assessments are typically: a) Given only at the beginning of 
the academic year b) Used to assign final grades c) Conducted throughout the 
academic year to monitor progress d) Only used for high-achieving students 

Answer: c) Conducted throughout the academic year to monitor progress 

Question 21: Summative assessments are typically: a) Used only for students with 
special needs b) Conducted only at the end of the academic year c) Given to compare 
students' performance to each other d) Used to provide ongoing feedback to students 

Answer: b) Conducted only at the end of the academic year 

Question 22: Assessment for learning helps teachers to: a) Assign final grades to 
students b) Identify areas for improvement in instruction c) Compare students' 
performance to each other d) Determine overall student achievement 

Answer: b) Identify areas for improvement in instruction 

Question 23: Assessment of learning helps teachers to: a) Monitor student progress 
and adjust instruction b) Provide ongoing formative feedback to students c) Assign 
final grades to students d) Focus on individual student needs and growth 

Answer: c) Assign final grades to students 

Question 24: The purpose of Assessment for learning is to: a) Assign final grades to 
students b) Provide feedback and guide instruction c) Determine overall student 
achievement d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: b) Provide feedback and guide instruction 

Question 25: The purpose of Assessment of learning is to: a) Monitor student 
progress and adjust instruction b) Provide formative feedback to students c) Assign 
final grades to students d) Focus on individual student needs and growth 

Answer: c) Assign final grades to students 

Question 26: Which type of assessment is more likely to be qualitative and 

ongoing? a) Formative assessment b) Summative assessment c) Both formative and 
summative assessments d) Neither formative nor summative assessments 

Answer: a) Formative assessment 
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Question 27: Which type of assessment is more likely to be quantitative and final? 
a) Formative assessment b) Summative assessment c) Both formative and summative 
assessments d) Neither formative nor summative assessments 

Answer: b) Summative assessment 

Question 28: The main focus of Assessment for learning is on: a) Assigning final 
grades to students b) Determining overall student achievement c) Providing feedback 
and guiding instruction d) Conducting standardized tests 

Answer: c) Providing feedback and guiding instruction 

Question 29: The main focus of Assessment of learning is on: a) Monitoring student 
progress and adjusting instruction b) Comparing students' performance to each other 
c) Providing ongoing feedback to students d) Determining overall student 
achievement 

Answer: d) Determining overall student achievement 

Question 30: Which of the following is a characteristic of School-Based 

Assessment? a) Conducted by external agencies only b) Relies solely on final exams 
for evaluation c) Conducted within the school by teachers d) Focuses solely on student 
self-assessment 

Answer: c) Conducted within the school by teachers 

Question 31: The key principle of Continuous and Comprehensive Evaluation 

(CCE) is to: a) Assign grades based on teacher judgment b) Rely solely on 
standardized tests for evaluations c) Continuously assess and improve student 
learning through various methods d) Conduct assessments only at the end of the 
academic year 

Answer: c) Continuously assess and improve student learning through various 

methods 

Question 32: Assessment for learning is an ongoing process that: a) Focuses solely 
on final exams b) Assigns grades based on standardized tests c) Takes place only at 
the beginning of the academic year d) Informs instruction and supports student 
learning 

Answer: d) Informs instruction and supports student learning 

Question 33: Assessment of learning occurs at specific points in time to: a) Inform 
instruction and improve learning b) Monitor student progress and provide ongoing 
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feedback c) Assign grades based on formative assessments d) Determine overall 
student achievement 

Answer: d) Determine overall student achievement 

Question 34: Which of the following statements is true about the role of teachers in 

Assessment for learning? a) Teachers play a passive role and only administer tests b) 
Teachers are solely responsible for assigning final grades c) Teachers play an active 
role in guiding instruction and providing feedback d) Teachers are not involved in 
assessment processes 

Answer: c) Teachers play an active role in guiding instruction and providing 

feedback 

Question 35: Which of the following statements is true about the role of teachers in 

Assessment of learning? a) Teachers play a passive role and only administer tests b) 
Teachers are solely responsible for assigning final grades c) Teachers play an active 
role in guiding instruction and providing feedback d) Teachers are not involved in 
assessment processes 

Answer: b) Teachers are solely responsible for assigning final grades 

Question 36: Which of the following best describes Assessment for learning? a) It 
emphasizes evaluating only cognitive skills b) It takes place only at the end of the 
academic year c) It guides instructional decisions and helps students improve d) It 
focuses solely on standardized tests 

Answer: c) It guides instructional decisions and helps students improve 

Question 37: Which of the following best describes Assessment of learning? a) It 
emphasizes evaluating only cognitive skills b) It takes place only at the beginning of 
the academic year c) It guides instructional decisions and helps students improve d) 
It focuses solely on formative assessments 

Answer: a) It emphasizes evaluating only cognitive skills 

Question 38: School-Based Assessment involves: a) Assessments conducted by 
external agencies only b) Assessments solely based on final exams c) Assessments 
conducted within the school by teachers d) Assessments conducted by parents 

Answer: c) Assessments conducted within the school by teachers 

Question 39: Continuous and Comprehensive Evaluation (CCE) involves: a) Only 
assessing cognitive skills b) Assessing students solely through final exams c) 
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Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the year d) 
Assessing students only at the end of the academic year 

Answer: c) Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the 

year 

Question 40: Assessment for learning is primarily focused on: a) Assigning grades 
and rankings to students b) Comparing students' performance to each other c) 
Monitoring student progress and adjusting instruction d) Testing memorization skills 

Answer: c) Monitoring student progress and adjusting instruction 

Question 41: Assessment of learning is primarily focused on: a) Adjusting teaching 
methods b) Providing formative feedback c) Continuous monitoring of student 
progress d) Summative evaluations and assigning grades 

Answer: d) Summative evaluations and assigning grades 

Question 42: School-Based Assessment refers to: a) Assessments conducted by 
external agencies only b) Assessments solely based on final exams c) Assessments 
conducted within the school by teachers d) Assessments conducted by parents 

Answer: c) Assessments conducted within the school by teachers 

Question 43: Continuous and Comprehensive Evaluation (CCE) refers to: a) Only 
assessing cognitive skills b) Assessing students solely through final exams c) 
Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the year d) 
Assessing students only at the end of the academic year 

Answer: c) Assessing students using a variety of tools and methods throughout the 

year 

Question 44: The primary purpose of Assessment for learning is to: a) Assign grades 
and rankings to students b) Determine the overall achievement of students c) Guide 
instruction and improve learning d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: c) Guide instruction and improve learning 

Question 45: The primary purpose of Assessment of learning is to: a) Provide 
formative feedback to students b) Guide instructional planning c) Identify areas for 
improvement in instruction d) Determine the overall achievement of students 

Answer: d) Determine the overall achievement of students 
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Question 46: Formative assessments are used to: a) Assign final grades b) Evaluate 
student achievement at the end of the year c) Monitor student progress and provide 
feedback d) Compare students' performance to each other 

Answer: c) Monitor student progress and provide feedback 

Question 47: Summative assessments are used to: a) Assign final grades during the 
academic year b) Evaluate student achievement at the end of the year c) Monitor 
student progress and provide feedback d) Compare students' performance to each 
other 

Answer: b) Evaluate student achievement at the end of the year 

Question 48: In Assessment for learning, feedback is primarily used to: a) Assign 
grades and rankings to students b) Compare students' performance to each other c) 
Guide instructional decisions and help students improve d) Determine overall student 
achievement 

Answer: c) Guide instructional decisions and help students improve 

Question 49: In Assessment of learning, feedback is primarily used to: a) Guide 
instructional decisions and help students improve b) Compare students' performance 
to each other c) Assign final grades and rankings to students d) Determine overall 
student achievement 

Answer: d) Determine overall student achievement 

Question 50: Formative assessments in Assessment for learning are intended to: a) 
Guide instructional decisions and improve learning b) Determine overall student 
achievement c) Assign grades and rankings to students d) Compare students' 
performance to each other 

Answer: a) Guide instructional decisions and improve learning 
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